



## *Procurement Department*

---

Memo To: Responding Vendors to Quote#543  
From: Teria G. Sheffield, Procurement Director  
Subject: Tabulation of Quote  
Date: November 23, 2021

Having reviewed quotes from many high-quality vendors, we have concluded that those vendors highlighted below best matches the needs of York County Government.

Quotes accepted on November 9, 2021 for prices on janitorial supplies to be purchased during the 2022 year. Please find tabulation on the following pages.

Thank you for your continued interest in doing business with York County Government.

Quote 543  
TGS/jkc

#1- Toilet Tissue, single ply, must measure 4.375 x 3.75, please also quote 2-ply- Samples requested (EXO-P96500)

	Brand Name & Stock#	"Green" Alternative	Quantity/CS	Price/EA	Price/CS
Forms & Supply, INC	CT Paper** CPC95000 (1-ply), 4.15 x 3.5, CPC95003 (2-ply)-4.5 x 3.5	Price valid through 12/31/22	96/CT (purchase by CT)	32.41/CT, 33.27/CT (2-ply)	32.41/CT, 33.27/CT (2-ply)
Herald Office Supply	# 5501 Von Drehle Blue Mist 1-ply, #RT500 Von Drehle Feather Soft	#5501, # RT500	500 Sheets/96 Rolls	.543, .442	52.17, 42.41
<b>Interstate Solutions</b>	<b>VON-5022</b>	<b>Yes</b>	<b>96 rolls/500 sht</b>	<b>-</b>	<b>32.6</b>
Bison Productions Company	No Bid				
Clearwater Distribution dba Gulfstar Supply	No Bid				
Interboro Packaging	No Bid				
Pyramid School Products	No Bid				
The Glove Box	No Bid				
UniPak Corporation	No Bid				
United Sales USA	GEN8000	-	96	0.33	32.35
Malor & Company	Ecom F313	-	4.3x3.75, 2-ply	20	55
Healthy School Supply	No Bid				
Central Poly Bag Corporation	Resolute #115, Resolute # 235	Same	4.0x3.1, 1000/96/cs, 4.4x3.5 500/96/cs	.604, .50	58, 48
R.S Hughes	Boardwalk BWK6170B	-	96 rolls/Case	.64 per roll	61.52

#2- Roll Paper Towels, Perforated 2-ply, (Baywest 410)

	Brand Name & Stock#	"Green" Alternative	Quantity/CS	Price/EA	Price/CS
Forms & Supply, INC	CT Paper, CPC60006	Price valid through 12/31/22	30/CT (purchase by CT)	18.75/CT	18.75/CT
Herald Office Supply	Von Drehle Preserve # 4100	Von Drehle Preserve # 4100	85 Sheets/30 Rolls	0.812	24.34
Interstate Solutions	SCA-HB1900A	Yes	30ctx84sheets	-	18.4
Bison Productions Company	No Bid				
Clearwater Distribution dba Gulfstar Supply	No Bid				
Interboro Packaging	No Bid				
Pyramid School Products	No Bid				
The Glove Box	No Bid				
UniPak Corporation	No Bid				
United Sales USA	Gen1797	-	30	0.76	23
Malor & Company	Ecom F452	-	2-ply	20	50
Healthy School Supply	No Bid				
Central Poly Bag Corporation	Marcal #06350	Same	85/30/cs	0.83	25
R.S Hughes	Boardwalk BWK6272	-	30 rolls	.82 per roll	24.81

**#3- Multifold Paper Towels,  
Unbleached (SCA-MK530E)**

	Brand Name & Stock#	"Green" Alternative	Quantity/CS	Price/EA	Price/CS
Forms & Supply, INC	CT Paper CPC54002	Price valid through 12/31/2021	4000/CT ( purchase by CT)	15.83/CT	15.83/CT
Herald Office Supply	Von Drehle Baseline #B925N	Von Drehle Baseline #B925N	250 Sheets PK, 4000 per case	1.129	18.07
<b>Interstate Solutions</b>	<b>TUG-529N</b>	<b>Yes</b>	<b>16x250CT</b>	<b>-</b>	<b>14.65</b>
Bison Productions Company	No Bid				
Clearwater Distribution dba	No Bid				
Gulfstar Supply	No Bid				
Interboro Packaging	No Bid				
Pyramid School Products	No Bid				
The Glove Box	No Bid				
UniPak Corporation	No Bid				
United Sales USA	Gen1520		12	1.58	19.5
Malor & Company	No Bid				
Healthy School Supply	No Bid				
Central Poly Bag Corporation	Marcal #P200N	Same	4000	0.006	23
R.S Hughes	GEN Gen 1508	-	250/pk, 16 pk/carton	1.06	17.04

**#4- Natural Roll Hand Towel (Tork 290088)**

	Brand Name & Stock#	"Green" Alternative	Quantity/CS	Price/EA	Price/CS
Forms & Supply, INC	No Bid				
Herald Office Supply	Von Drehle # B80N	Von Drehle # B80N	800 ft, 6 rolls	3.253	19.52
<b>Interstate Solutions</b>	<b>SCA-290088</b>	<b>Yes</b>	<b>6x700'</b>	<b>-</b>	<b>32.7</b>
Bison Productions Company	No Bid				
Clearwater Distribution dba Gulfstar Supply	No Bid				
Interboro Packaging	No Bid				
Pyramid School Products	No Bid				
The Glove Box	No Bid				
UniPak Corporation	No Bid				
United Sales USA	CSDH235	-	12	1.64	19.75
Malor & Company	No Bid				
Healthy School Supply	No Bid				
Central Poly Bag Corporation	No Bid				
R.S Hughes	Boardwalk BWK6256	-	800 ft /roll, 6 roll/carton	3.77	22.67

**#5- Styrofoam Cups, 8 oz**

	Brand Name & Stock#	"Green" Alternative	Quantity/CS	Price/EA	Price/CS
Forms & Supply, INC	Genuine Joe GJO58550	Pricing valid for 30 days	1000/CT (purchase by CT	26.35/CT	26.35/CT
<b>Herald Office Supply</b>	<b>Genuine Joe , 8 oz, # 58550</b>	-	<b>50 per tube, 20 tubes</b>	<b>0.96</b>	<b>19.2</b>
Interstate Solutions	DART-8J8	-	1000CT	-	33
Bison Productions Company	No Bid				
Clearwater Distribution dba	No Bid				
Gulfstar Supply	No Bid				
Interboro Packaging	No Bid				
Pyramid School Products	No Bid				
The Glove Box	No Bid				
UniPak Corporation	No Bid				
United Sales USA	No Bid				
Malor & Company	No Bid				
Healthy School Supply	No Bid				
Central Poly Bag Corporation	No Bid				
R.S Hughes	Dart DCC8j8BG	-	25 cups/pk	0.04	1.08
<hr/>					
<b>#6- Mop Head, 16 oz, Rayon 4-ply</b>					
<b>-Sample Requested</b>					
<hr/>					
	Brand Name & Stock#	"Green" Alternative	Quantity/CS	Price/EA	Price/CS

Forms & Supply, INC	Janico GJOA16Ray	Price valid until 3/31/22	EA	4.02/EA	4.02/EA
Herald Office Supply	Genuine Joe, # GJON16RAY	-	Each 12 Case	4.28	51.36
<b>Interstate Solutions</b>	<b>MP-16R</b>	-	<b>12/Case</b>	<b>2.75</b>	<b>33</b>
Bison Productions Company	No Bid				
Clearwater Distribution dba Gulfstar Supply	No Bid				
Interboro Packaging	No Bid				
Pyramid School Products	ABCO #RM33016	N/A	12 Ea/cs	4.29 ea	51.48
The Glove Box	No Bid				
UniPak Corporation	No Bid				
United Sales USA	No Bid				
Malor & Company	No Bid				
Healthy School Supply	No Bid				
Central Poly Bag Corporation	No Bid				
R.S Hughes	Boardwalk BWK216RCT	-	12/carton	5.06	60.82

---

**#7- Mop Head, 24 oz, Rayon, 4-  
ply -Samples Requested**

---

	Brand Name & Stock#	"Green" Alternative	Quantity/CS	Price/EA	Price/CS
Forms & Supply, INC	Janico, JAN3763	Price valid until 3/31/22	EA (Must order in multiples of 12)	5.91/EA	70.92/DZ
Herald Office Supply	Genuine Joe # GJON24RAY	-	Each 12 Case	5.28	63.36
<b>Interstate Solutions</b>	<b>MP-24R</b>	-	<b>12/Case</b>	<b>4</b>	<b>48</b>
Bison Productions Company	No Bid				

Clearwater Distribution dba Gulfstar Supply	No Bid				
Interboro Packaging	No Bid				
Pyramid School Products	ABCO #RM33024	N/A	12 EA/cs	5.39 ea	64.68
The Glove Box	No Bid				
UniPak Corporation	No Bid				
United Sales USA	No Bid				
Malor & Company	No Bid				
Healthy School Supply	No Bid				
Central Poly Bag Corporation	No Bid				
R.S Hughes	Boardwalk BWK224RCT	-	12/carton	7.09	85.09

**#8- Mop Head, 32 oz, Rayon, 4-  
ply -Samples Requested**

	Brand Name & Stock#	"Green" Alternative	Quantity/CS	Price/EA	Price/CS
Forms & Supply, INC	Janico Jan3764	Price valid until 3/31/22	EA (Must order in multiples of 12)	7.94/EA	95.28/DZ
Herald Office Supply	Rubbermaid # FGV41900WH00	-	Each 12 Case	5.8	69.6
<b>Interstate Solutions</b>	<b>MP-32R</b>	<b>-</b>	<b>12/Case</b>	<b>4.69</b>	<b>56.28</b>
Bison Productions Company	No Bid				
Clearwater Distribution dba Gulfstar Supply	No Bid				
Interboro Packaging	No Bid				
Pyramid School Products	ABCO #RM33032	N/A	12 EA/cs	7.29 ea	87.48
The Glove Box	No Bid				
UniPak Corporation	No Bid				



United Sales USA	No Bid				
Malor & Company	No Bid				
Healthy School Supply	No Bid				
Central Poly Bag Corporation	No Bid				
R.S Hughes	Boardwalk BWK232R	-	12/carton	9.09	109

**#9- Gloves- Vinyl Exam, Powder Free, Various Sizes -Samples Requested**

	Brand Name & Stock#	"Green" Alternative	Quantity/CS	Price/EA	Price/CS
Forms & Supply, INC	Hospesco (HOSGLV104FS, HOSGLV104FM, HOSGLV104FL, HOSGLV104FXL)	Pricing valid for 30 days	100/BX	4.88/BX	4.88/BX
Herald Office Supply	AmerCare 500 Series	-	100 box/10 boxes per case	9.333	93.33
Interstate Solutions	HOSPECO GLOVES, 103 Series	-	10 boxes x 100	3.5	35
Bison Productions Company	Kleen Chef Disposable	-	1000 pcs/case	5.5	55
Clearwater Distribution dba Gulfstar Supply	Sempermed Sempercure EVNP	None	1000	0.035	35
Interboro Packaging	Safeko-SM,med,lrg, xl-VPPG-E, As per sample #9	-	1000 per case	0.039	39
Pyramid School Products	Hospesco # GLV104F-Size	N/A	100/BX, 10 bx/cs	5.79 bx	57.90 cs
The Glove Box	MedPride MPR-5090X	-	100/BX, 10 bx/cs		39.3

UniPak Corporation	VPF	Genene	10/100	.048 each, 48/1000	48
United Sales USA	EMARLD040717	-	100	0.5	50
Malor & Company	XCYILAO	-	10 boxes, 1000	7.31	73.1
Healthy School Supply	Innovate Viny	N/A	1000 gloves per case	0.0695	69.5
Central Poly Bag Corporation	No Bid				
R.S Hughes	Adenna GL-V104FL	-	10 pk of 100 per case	3.416	34.16

**#10- Gloves- Nitrile Exam, Powder Free, 6 mil 9" cuff, latex free- Samples Requested- (AMC-6099)**

	Brand Name & Stock#	"Green" Alternative	Quantity/CS	Price/EA	Price/CS
Forms & Supply, INC	Hospeco ( HOSGLNB107FS, HOSGLNB107FM, HOSGLNB107FL, HOSGLNB107FX)	Pricing valid for 30 days	100/BX	22.10/BX	22.10/BX
Herald Office Supply	AmerCare 6099 Series	-	100 box/10 boxes per case	16.667	166.67
Interstate Solutions	HOSPECO GLOVES 106 Series	-	10 boxes x 100	12.65	126.5
<b>Bison Productions Company</b>	<b>Kleen Chef Disposable</b>	<b>-</b>	<b>1000 pcs/case</b>	<b>7.75</b>	<b>77.5</b>
Clearwater Distribution dba Gulfstar Supply	Sempermed Sempergard INIHD	None	1000	0.198	198
Interboro Packaging	Safeko-sm,med,lrg, xl-NPFG-E, As per sample	-	1000 per cse	0.118	118

Pyramid School Products	Hospesco # GLN107F- Size	N/A	100/Bx, 10 Bx/Cs	15.99 bx	159.9
The Glove Box	Shamrock 8011X	-	100/BX, 10 Bx/CS, 1000/CS	-	87
UniPak Corporation	NPF	Genene	10/100	.125, 125/1000	125
United Sales USA	EMARLD40716	-	100	0.9	90
Malor & Company	XCYILAO	-	10 boxes, 1000	12.21	122.1
Healthy School Supply	Innovate Nitrile Examination Gloves	N/A	1000 gloves per Case	0.0924	92.4
Central Poly Bag Corporation	No Bid				
R.S Hughes	Adenna SHD936, GL-N105FL, GL-N145FL	-	10 pk of 100 per case	13, 12.30, 11.10- (box)	130, 123, 111

**#11- Bleach- Clorox Brand, .96 oz**

	Brand Name & Stock#	"Green" Alternative	Quantity/CS	Price/EA	Price/CS
Forms & Supply, INC	Clorox, CLO30966CT	Pricing valid for 30 days	3/CT	15.65/CT	15.65/CT
Herald Office Supply	Clorox Germicidal Bleach #30966	-	121 oz. 3 per Case	5.94	17.82
Interstate Solutions	CLO-30966	-	3x121 oz	-	15.52
Bison Productions Company	No Bid				
Clearwater Distribution dba	No Bid				
Gulfstar Supply	No Bid				
Interboro Packaging	No Bid				
Pyramid School Products	No Bid				
The Glove Box	No Bid				
UniPak Corporation	No Bid				

United Sales USA	No Bid				
Malor & Company	No Bid				
Healthy School Supply	Clorox Brand	N/A	3 bottles per case	8.4	25.2
Central Poly Bag Corporation	No Bid				
R.S Hughes	Clorox- CLO30966CT	-	3 per cart	5.84	17.53